Bid File: #340-34-19 TTEM 1 TTEM 2 ITEM 3 TTEM 4 ITEM 5
Bid Opening Date: May 30, 2024
For: Firefighting Gear: Turnout, Hoods, Gloves, Helmef| Firefighting | Firefighting Firefighting Turnout Gear Turnout Gear
# Bidders Solicited: 116 Boot, Hood, Helmet, Mens, Morning Pride Mens, Morning Pride Tails
Buyer: Jeffrey Poll Globe Shadow | Globe Guard | Honeywell Ben 3 | Tails, Jacket/Trouser Set| Oversize Jacket/Trouser
Dept: Fire $/Pair $/Each $/Each $/Set $/Set
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Axes and Irons
920 O Malley No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Coopersville, Ml 49404
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid $475.00 $3,190.00 $3,190.00
Municipal Emergency Services
12 Turnberry Ln No Bid No Bid $525.00 $3,505.00 $3,505.00
Sandy Hook, CT 06482
No Bid No Bid $575.00 $3,855.00 $3,855.00
$525.00 $110.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
MacQueen Equipment
78 Northpointe Dr $545.00 $122.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lake Orion, MI 48359
$580.00 $130.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
West Shore Fire Inc.
6620 Lake Michigan Drive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Allendale, MI 49401
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITEM 7

ITEM 8

ITEM9

ITEM 10

For: Firefighting Gear: Turnout, Hoods, Gloves, Helmet

# Bidders Solicited: 116

Turnout Gear
Mens, Morning Pride

Turnout Gear
Mens, Morning Pride

Turnout Gear
Mens, Morning Pride

Turnout Gear
Mens, Morning Pride

Turnout Gear
Womens, Morning

Buyer: Jeffrey Poll Tails, Jacket Tails, Jacket, Oversize Tails, Trousers Trousers, Oversize |Pride, Jacket/Trouser
Dept: Fire $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Set
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Axes and Irons
920 O Malley No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Coopersville, Ml 49404
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$1,775.00 $1,775.00 $1,415.00 $1,415.00 $3,190.00
Municipal Emergency Services
12 Turnberry Ln $1,950.00 $1,950.00 $1,555.00 $1,555.00 $3,505.00
Sandy Hook, CT 06482
$2,145.00 $2,145.00 $1,710.00 $1,710.00 $3,855.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MacQueen Equipment
78 Northpointe Dr No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lake Orion, MI 48359
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
West Shore Fire Inc.
6620 Lake Michigan Drive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Allendale, MI 49401
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid File: #340-34-19 TTEM 11 ITEM 12 ITEM 13 TTEM 14
Bid Opening Date: May 30, 2024
For: Firefighting Gear: Turnout, Hoods, Gloves, Helmet Turnout Gear Turnout Gear Turnout Gear Turnout Gear
# Bidders Solicited: 116 Womens, Morning Pride Womens, Morning Pride | Womens, Morning Pride | Womens, Morning Pride
Buyer: Jeffrey Poll Tails, Oversize Jacket/Trousers Tails, Jacket Tails, Jacket, Oversize Tails, Trousers
Dept: Fire $/Set $/Each $/Each $/Each
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Axes and Irons
920 O Malley No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Coopersville, Ml 49404
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$3,190.00 $1,775.00 $1,775.00 $1,415.00
Municipal Emergency Services
12 Turnberry Ln $3,505.00 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 $1,555.00
Sandy Hook, CT 06482
$3,855.00 $2,145.00 $2,145.00 $1,710.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MacQueen Equipment
78 Northpointe Dr No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lake Orion, M| 48359
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
West Shore Fire Inc.
6620 Lake Michigan Drive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Allendale, Ml 49401
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid File: #340-34-19 ITEM 15 ITEM 16
Bid Opening Date: May 30, 2024
For: Firefighting Gear: Turnout, Hoods, Gloves, Helmet Turnout Gear Fire-Dex Leather
# Bidders Solicited: 116 Womens, Morning Pride Dex-Pro Gloves
Buyer: Jeffrey Poll Tails, Trousers, Oversize | Gauntlet Style Wrist
Dept: Fire $/Each $/Pair
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
No Bid $111.88
Axes and Irons
920 O Malley No Bid $117.48
Coopersville, Ml 49404
No Bid $123.36
$1,415.00 $115.00
Municipal Emergency Services
12 Turnberry Ln $1,555.00 $125.00
Sandy Hook, CT 06482
$1,710.00 $135.00
No Bid No Bid
MacQueen Equipment
78 Northpointe Dr No Bid No Bid
Lake Orion, M| 48359
No Bid No Bid
No Bid $115.00
West Shore Fire Inc.
6620 Lake Michigan Drive No Bid $123.00
Allendale, Ml 49401
No Bid $131.00
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