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BID FILE #340-60-31 ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEM 5 ITEM 6
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts Fire Hydrant Fire Hydrant Fire Hydrant Fire Hydrant Fire Hydrant Fire Hydrant
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55 East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan
BUYER:  DW #5-BR 250 Conversion, 5' Conversion, 5'6" Conversion, 6' Conversion, 6'6" Conversion, 7'
DEPT:  Water $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

$2,964.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue $3,152.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

$3,356.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks $2,899.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512 $2,987.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$3,077.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kentwood, MI  49512

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITEM 7 ITEM 8 ITEM 9 ITEM 10 ITEM 11 ITEM 12 ITEM 13

Fire Hydrant Fire Hydrant East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan
East Jordan East Jordan Conversion to Hydrant Ext. Hydrant Ext. Hydrant Ext. Hydrant Ext.

Conversion, 7'6" Conversion, 8' Traverse City Old Style, 6" Old Style, 12" Old Style, 18" Old Style, 24"
$/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each

No Bid No Bid No Bid $410.90 $502.30 $526.85 $590.10

No Bid No Bid No Bid $437.00 $534.20 $560.35 $627.60

No Bid No Bid No Bid $465.25 $568.75 $596.60 $667.25

No Bid No Bid No Bid $411.00 $503.00 $521.00 $58.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid $423.00 $517.00 $537.00 $607.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid $440.00 $532.00 $553.00 $626.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BID FILE #340-60-31
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55
BUYER:  DW
DEPT:  Water

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512

Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512
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ITEM 14 ITEM 15 ITEM 16 ITEM 17 ITEM 18 ITEM 19 ITEM 20

East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan
Hydrant Ext. Hydrant Ext. Hydrant Ext. Hydrant Ext. Hydrant Ext. Hydrant Ext. Hydrant Ext.
New Style, 6" New Style, 12" New Style, 18" New Style, 24" Stem, 6" Stem, 12" Stem, 18"

$/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each

$339.50 $391.00 $442.15 $497.40 $47.80 $47.35 $54.60

$361.05 $415.65 $470.65 $529.00 $50.80 $50.35 $58.05

$384.40 $442.50 $500.65 $563.25 $54.10 $53.60 $51.85

$339.00 $391.00 $437.50 $497.00 $47.79 $47.32 $54.00

$350.00 $403.00 $446.00 $512.00 $49.22 $48.74 $55.57

$360.00 $414.00 $460.00 $527.00 $50.71 $50.20 $57.33

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BID FILE #340-60-31
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55
BUYER:  DW
DEPT:  Water

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512

Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512
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ITEM 21 ITEM 22 ITEM 23 ITEM 24 ITEM 25 ITEM 26

East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan
Hydrant Ext. #14 Swivel Flanges #22 Swivel Flanges #15 Upper #19 Lower #17 Quad

Stem, 24" Old Style New Style Flange Gasket Flange Gasket Seal O-Ring
$/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each

$62.50 $39.45 $32.75 $23.60 $6.60 $10.75

$66.45 $42.00 $34.80 $25.05 $7.00 $11.40

$70.75 $44.70 $37.05 $26.65 $7.45 $12.15

$61.81 $80.00 $68.00 $23.30 $7.30 $11.00

$63.67 $82.00 $70.00 $24.25 $8.00 $12.00

$65.57 $84.00 $72.00 $25.00 $9.00 $13.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BID FILE #340-60-31
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55
BUYER:  DW
DEPT:  Water

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512

Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512
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ITEM 27 ITEM 28 ITEM 29 ITEM 30 ITEM 31 ITEM 32

East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan
#33 Inlet #4 & #27 Drip #4 & #27 Drip #5 & #29 Valve #5 & #29 Valve #6 Vale Washer

Flange O-Ring Shut-Off, Bronze, 5" Shut-Off, Bronze, 6" Seat, Bronze, 5" Seat, Bronze, 6" Cast Iron
$/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each

$6.60 $126.05 $89.50 $242.40 $125.35 $21.40

$7.00 $134.05 $95.20 $257.75 $133.30 $22.70

$7.45 $142.70 $101.35 $274.45 $141.95 $24.20

$7.00 $126.00 $87.66 $239.84 $124.00 $21.15

$8.00 $129.00 $90.29 $247.00 $127.00 $21.78

$9.00 $133.00 $93.00 $254.45 $131.00 $22.44

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BID FILE #340-60-31
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55
BUYER:  DW
DEPT:  Water

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512

Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512
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ITEM 33 ITEM 34 ITEM 35 ITEM 36 ITEM 37 ITEM 38

East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan
#35 Valve Washer #7 & #2 Hold #8 & #1 Operating #9 & #13 Pumper #10 & #14 #11 & #16 

Ductile Iron Down Nut, Brass Nut Brass Nozzle, Brass Pumper Cap C.I. Reservoir O-ring
$/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each

$31.75 $56.85 $102.25 $122.65 $118.30 $3.20

$33.75 $60.45 $108.70 $130.40 $125.80 $3.40

$35.95 $64.35 $115.75 $138.85 $133.95 $3.60

$31.42 $56.26 $101.00 $121.35 $117.00 $4.00

$32.35 $57.95 $104.00 $123.71 $119.32 $5.00

$33.33 $59.69 $107.00 $127.41 $123.00 $6.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BID FILE #340-60-31
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55
BUYER:  DW
DEPT:  Water

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512

Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512
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ITEM 39 ITEM 40 ITEM 41 ITEM 42 ITEM 43 ITEM 44

East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan
#12-A & #6 #12-B & #26 #16 & #34 Seating #16 & #34 Seating #17 & #28 #18 & #11 Pumper 

Oper. Stem Top Oper. Stem Lower Valve Rubber, 5" Valve Rubber, 6" Inserts Nozzle Cap Gasket
$/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each

$84.90 $95.15 $55.85 $103.65 $4.85 $7.40

$90.25 $101.15 $59.40 $110.25 $5.15 $7.90

$96.10 $107.70 $63.20 $117.35 $5.45 $8.40

$84.86 $95.13 $55.84 $72.00 $6.00 $8.00

$87.41 $96.96 $57.00 $74.22 $7.00 $8.50

$90.00 $99.86 $59.24 $76.45 $8.00 $9.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BID FILE #340-60-31
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55
BUYER:  DW
DEPT:  Water

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512

Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512
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ITEM 45 ITEM 46 ITEM 47 ITEM 48 ITEM 49 ITEM 50

East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan
#20 & #12 Pumper #21 & #7 Hose #22 & #19 #23 & #8 Hose #24 & #9 Hose #25 & #10 Hose 

Nozzle O-ring Nozzle O-ring Drive Loc Pin Nozzle, Brass Nozzle Cap Nozzle Cap Gasket
$/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each

$4.65 $2.00 $5.52 $49.50 $45.45 $1.80

$5.00 $2.15 $5.81 $53.10 $48.30 $1.90

$5.25 $2.25 $6.12 $56.55 $51.40 $2.00

$5.00 $3.00 $6.25 $50.00 $45.00 $3.00

$6.00 $4.00 $7.00 $51.43 $46.26 $4.00

$7.00 $5.00 $8.00 $53.00 $47.69 $5.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BID FILE #340-60-31
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55
BUYER:  DW
DEPT:  Water

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512

Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512
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ITEM 51 ITEM 52 ITEM 53 ITEM 54 ITEM 55

East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan
#27 #31 Valve #28 & #3 Weather #29 Pin #24 Cotter Key #30 & #32 Stem
Seat O-rings Seal O-ring Coupling - Breakable

$/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each

$6.30 $5.70 $6.20 $1.80 $18.20

$6.65 $6.65 $6.55 $1.85 $19.30

$7.10 $7.10 $6.95 $2.00 $20.55

$6.40 $6.00 $6.50 $2.00 $18.75

$7.00 $7.00 $8.00 $3.00 $19.11

$8.00 $8.00 $9.00 $4.00 $19.89

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BID FILE #340-60-31
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55
BUYER:  DW
DEPT:  Water

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512

Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512
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ITEM 56 ITEM 57 ITEM 58 ITEM 59 ITEM 60 ITEM 61

East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan East Jordan
#30A Stem Coupling #34 & #39 #35 & #30 #36 & #15 #38 & #5 Hydrant Wrench

Non-Breakable Set Screw Bronze Liner Brass Collar Thrust Washer #91950
$/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each

$15.85 $0.60 $1,191.00 $75.75 $2.80 $48.75

$16.85 $0.65 $1,266.90 $80.55 $2.75 $51.85

$17.95 $0.70 $1,348.90 $85.75 $2.90 $55.20

$18.75 $1.00 $1,155.00 $75.00 $3.00 $48.75

$19.11 $2.00 $1,190.00 $77.00 $4.00 $50.21

$19.89 $3.00 $1,225.00 $79.00 $5.00 $51.72

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BID FILE #340-60-31
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55
BUYER:  DW
DEPT:  Water

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512

Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512
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ITEM 62 ITEM 63 ITEM 64 ITEM 65 ITEM 66 ITEM 67 ITEM 68

Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City
Part #F Part #G Part #H Part #I Part #J Part #K Part #L

$/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each

No Bid $318.35 $733.75 $120.35 $116.45 $289.60 $142.85

No Bid $343.80 $792.45 $56.45 $125.75 $312.75 $154.30

No Bid $369.30 $851.15 $139.60 $135.10 $335.95 $165.70

$287.87 No Bid $656.53 $108.83 $105.32 $261.89 $129.19

$310.90 No Bid $709.05 $117.53 $113.74 $282.84 $139.53

$333.94 No Bid $761.57 $126.24 $122.17 $303.80 $149.86

$300.67 No Bid $693.00 $113.67 $110.00 $273.54 $137.94

$324.73 No Bid $784.45 $122.76 $122.76 $295.42 $145.74

$348.78 No Bid $803.88 $131.86 $127.60 $317.30 $156.53

BID FILE #340-60-31
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55
BUYER:  DW
DEPT:  Water

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512

Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512
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ITEM 69 ITEM 70 ITEM 71 ITEM 72 ITEM 73 ITEM 74 ITEM 75

Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City
Part #M Part #N Part #O Part #P Part #R Part #S Part #T

$/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each

$322.25 $190.25 $73.75 No Bid $43.45 $1,290.50 $67.50

$348.00 $205.45 $79.65 No Bid $46.95 $1,393.70 $72.95

$373.75 $220.65 $85.55 No Bid $50.40 $1,496.95 $78.35

$291.38 $172.02 $68.15 No Bid $40.17 $1,130.85 $62.41

$314.69 $185.79 $73.61 No Bid $43.39 $1,221.31 $67.40

$338.00 $199.54 $79.05 No Bid $46.60 $1,331.78 $72.40

$304.34 $179.67 $69.67 No Bid $41.07 $1,218.80 $63.80

$328.68 $194.05 $75.25 No Bid $44.36 $1,316.30 $68.90

$353.03 $208.42 $80.42 No Bid $47.64 $1,413.82 $74.02

BID FILE #340-60-31
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55
BUYER:  DW
DEPT:  Water

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512

Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512
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ITEM 76 ITEM 77 ITEM 78 ITEM 79 ITEM 80 ITEM 81 ITEM 82

Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City
Part #U Part #W Part #X Part #Y Part #Z Part #X1 Part #X2

$/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each

$945.75 $10.85 $65.25 $4.65 $4.65 $27.15 $14.75

$1,021.75 $11.75 $70.45 $5.05 $5.05 $29.35 $15.90

$1,097.05 $12.60 $75.65 $5.40 $5.40 $31.50 $17.10

$837.38 $10.50 $60.26 $4.50 $4.50 $26.25 $14.25

$904.36 $11.34 $65.09 $4.86 $4.86 $28.35 $15.39

$971.35 $12.18 $69.90 $5.22 $5.22 $30.45 $16.53

$893.20 $9.24 $55.44 $4.40 $4.40 $25.67 $13.94

$964.66 $11.09 $66.54 $4.76 $4.76 $27.73 $15.05

$1,036.12 $11.92 $71.46 $5.10 $5.10 $29.78 $16.17

BID FILE #340-60-31
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55
BUYER:  DW
DEPT:  Water

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512

Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512
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ITEM 83 ITEM 84 ITEM 85 ITEM 86 ITEM 87 ITEM 88 ITEM 89

Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City Traverse City
Hydrant Hydrant Hydrant Hydrant Hydrant Ext. Hydrant Ext. Hydrant Ext.

Extension 6" Extension 12" Extension 18" Extension 24" Stem, 6" Stem, 12" Stem, 18"
$/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each

$2,004.85 $2,155.45 $2,310.00 $2,762.65 $260.90 $260.90 $260.90

$2,165.25 $2,327.90 $2,494.80 $2,983.70 $281.75 $281.75 $281.75

$2,325.65 $2,500.35 $2,679.60 $3,204.70 $302.65 $302.65 $302.65

$1,813.00 $1,950.00 $2,045.00 $2,472.00 $235.91 $235.91 $235.91

$1,958.00 $2,105.00 $2,209.00 $2,670.00 $254.79 $254.79 $254.79

$2,103.00 $2,261.00 $2,373.00 $2,868.00 $273.66 $273.66 $273.66

$1,893.47 $2,035.74 $2,181.67 $2,609.21 $246.40 $246.40 $246.40

$2,044.95 $2,198.59 $2,356.20 $2,817.94 $266.12 $266.12 $266.12

$2,196.43 $2,361.46 $2,530.74 $3,026.67 $285.83 $285.83 $285.83

BID FILE #340-60-31
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55
BUYER:  DW
DEPT:  Water

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512

Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512
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ITEM 90 ITEM 92 ITEM 93 ITEM 94 ITEM 95 ITEM 96 ITEM 97

Traverse City Clow Clow Clow Clow Clow Clow
Hydrant Ext. Hydrant Ext. Hydrant Ext. Hydrant Ext. Operating Thrust Thrust Bearing

Stem, 24" 12" 18" 24" Nut Nut Race
$/Each $Ea. $Ea. $Ea. $Ea. $Ea. $Ea.

$260.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$281.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$302.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$235.91 $825.00 $924.00 $1,010.00 $30.00 $57.00 No Bid

$254.79 $865.00 $969.00 $1,060.00 $32.00 $59.00 No Bid

$273.66 $900.00 $1,018.00 $1,115.00 $34.00 $63.00 No Bid

$246.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$266.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$285.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BID FILE #340-60-31
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55
BUYER:  DW
DEPT:  Water

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512

Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512
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ITEM 98 ITEM 99 ITEM 100 ITEM 101 ITEM 102 ITEM 103 ITEM 104 ITEM 105

Clow Clow Clow Clow Clow Clow Clow Clow
Cover Standpipe Valve Seal Lower Valve Retaining Valve Seal Stem Upper
Gasket Gasket Rubber Plate Ring Ring Coupling Stem CL

$Ea. $Ea. $Ea. $Ea. $Ea. $Ea. $Ea. $Ea.

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$18.00 No Bid $70.00 No Bid $14.00 $89.00 $112.00 $322.00

$19.00 No Bid $75.00 No Bid $16.00 $94.00 $118.00 $338.00

$20.00 No Bid $78.00 No Bid $18.00 $100.00 $124.00 $355.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BID FILE #340-60-31
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55
BUYER:  DW
DEPT:  Water

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512

Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512
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ITEM 106 ITEM 107 ITEM 108 ITEM 109 ITEM 110 ITEM 111

Clow Clow Clow Clow Clow Clow
Upper Stem Lower Steamer Hose Bearing Safety
Or 1018CRS Stem Nozzle 4" Nozzle Flange

$Ea. $Ea. $Ea. $Ea. $Ea. $Ea.

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$322.00 $276.00 $300.00 $137.00 No Bid $316.00

$338.00 $289.00 $315.00 $145.00 No Bid $331.00

$355.00 $305.00 $330.00 $151.00 No Bid $349.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BID FILE #340-60-31
BID OPENING DATE:   March 25, 2024
FOR: Fire Hydrants & Parts
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 55
BUYER:  DW
DEPT:  Water

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

ETNA Supply Company dba GRR Pipe
4901 Clay Avenue
Grand Rapids, MI  49548

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba Ferguson Waterworks
3900 44th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512

Core & Main
4530 36th Street SE
Kentwood, MI  49512


