

# BID TAB

<b>Bid File: #961-48-72</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: June 05, 2024</b> <b>For: Lab Analysis Services - General</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 104</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: ESD</b>		<b>ITEM 1</b>	<b>ITEM 2</b>	<b>ITEM 3</b>	<b>ITEM 4</b>	<b>ITEM 5</b>
		<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>
		<b>Fecal Coliform by enumeration method \$/Ea.</b>	<b>E. coli by enumeration method \$/Ea.</b>	<b>Volatile Acids \$/Ea.</b>	<b>Akalinity \$/Ea.</b>	<b>Bio-Chemical Oxygen Demand (BOD) \$/Ea.</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>Eurofins Environment Testing North Central, LLC</b> 4595 Broadmoor Ave SE, Ste 195 Grand Rapids, MI 49512		\$40.00	\$40.00	\$145.00	\$13.00	\$35.00
		\$40.00	\$40.00	\$145.00	\$13.00	\$35.00
		\$40.00	\$40.00	\$145.00	\$13.00	\$35.00
<b>RTI Laboratories</b> 31628 Glendale St Livonia, MI 48150		\$45.00	\$45.00	\$100.00	\$18.00	\$35.00
		\$46.00	\$46.00	\$102.00	\$19.00	\$36.00
		\$47.00	\$47.00	\$104.00	\$20.00	\$37.00
<b>Trace Analytical Laboratories, Inc.</b> 2241 Black Creek Rd Muskegon, MI 49444		\$19.00	\$19.00	\$86.00	\$12.50	\$23.00
		\$19.50	\$19.50	\$88.00	\$13.00	\$24.00
		\$20.00	\$20.00	\$90.00	\$13.50	\$25.00

# BID TAB

<b>Bid File: #961-48-72</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: June 05, 2024</b> <b>For: Lab Analysis Services - General</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 104</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: ESD</b>		<b>ITEM 6</b>	<b>ITEM 7</b>	<b>ITEM 8</b>	<b>ITEM 9</b>	<b>ITEM 10</b>
		<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>
		<b>Carbonaceous Bio-Chemical</b>	<b>Soluble Chemical Oxygen</b>	<b>Chemical Oxygen</b>	<b>Chloride</b>	<b>Chlorine (Residual)</b>
		<b>Oxygen Demand \$/Ea.</b>	<b>Demand (sCOD) \$/Ea.</b>	<b>Demand (COD) \$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>Eurofins Environment Testing North Central, LLC</b> 4595 Broadmoor Ave SE, Ste 195 Grand Rapids, MI 49512		\$35.00	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$11.00	\$11.00
		\$35.00	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$11.00	\$11.00
		\$35.00	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$11.00	\$11.00
<b>RTI Laboratories</b> 31628 Glendale St Livonia, MI 48150		\$35.00	\$45.00	\$35.00	\$20.00	\$15.00
		\$36.00	\$46.00	\$36.00	\$21.00	\$16.00
		\$37.00	\$47.00	\$37.00	\$22.00	\$17.00
<b>Trace Analytical Laboratories, Inc.</b> 2241 Black Creek Rd Muskegon, MI 49444		\$23.00	\$16.50	\$16.50	\$11.50	\$17.50
		\$24.00	\$17.00	\$17.00	\$12.00	\$18.00
		\$25.00	\$17.50	\$17.50	\$12.50	\$18.50

# BID TAB

<b>Bid File: #961-48-72</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: June 05, 2024</b> <b>For: Lab Analysis Services - General</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 104</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: ESD</b>		<b>ITEM 11</b>	<b>ITEM 12</b>	<b>ITEM 13</b>	<b>ITEM 14</b>	<b>ITEM 15</b>
		<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>
		<b>Conductivity</b>	<b>Color</b>	<b>Total Cyanide</b>	<b>Free Cyanide</b>	<b>Available Cyanide</b>
		<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>Eurofins Environment Testing North Central, LLC</b> 4595 Broadmoor Ave SE, Ste 195 Grand Rapids, MI 49512		\$11.00	\$17.00	\$21.00 \$24.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
		\$11.00	\$17.00	\$21.00 \$24.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
		\$11.00	\$17.00	\$21.00 \$24.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
<b>RTI Laboratories</b> 31628 Glendale St Livonia, MI 48150		\$15.00	\$18.00	\$30.00 \$40.00	\$85.00	\$50.00
		\$16.00	\$19.00	\$41.00 \$41.00	\$87.00	\$51.00
		\$17.00	\$20.00	\$42.00 \$42.00	\$89.00	\$52.00
<b>Trace Analytical Laboratories, Inc.</b> 2241 Black Creek Rd Muskegon, MI 49444		\$11.50	\$16.50	\$23.00	\$28.00	\$28.00
		\$12.00	\$17.00	\$24.00	\$29.00	\$29.00
		\$12.50	\$17.50	\$25.00	\$30.00	\$30.00

# BID TAB

<b>Bid File: #961-48-72</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: June 05, 2024</b> <b>For: Lab Analysis Services - General</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 104</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: ESD</b>		<b>ITEM 16</b>	<b>ITEM 17</b>	<b>ITEM 18</b>	<b>ITEM 19</b>	<b>ITEM 20</b>
		<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>
		<b>Chromium Hexavalent</b>	<b>Chromium Hexavalent</b>	<b>Fluoride Chromium</b>	<b>Calcium Carbonate</b>	<b>Methyl Blue Active Substances</b>
		<b>Method OIA-1677</b>	<b>by IC</b>	<b>in solids</b>	<b>Hardness</b>	<b>MBAS</b>
		<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>Eurofins Environment Testing North Central, LLC</b> 4595 Broadmoor Ave SE, Ste 195 Grand Rapids, MI 49512		\$30.00				
		\$85.00	\$95.00	\$11.00	\$10.00	\$38.00
		\$30.00				
		\$85.00	\$95.00	\$11.00	\$10.00	\$38.00
<b>RTI Laboratories</b> 31628 Glendale St Livonia, MI 48150		\$30.00				
		\$85.00	\$95.00	\$11.00	\$10.00	\$38.00
		\$30.00				
		\$85.00	\$95.00	\$11.00	\$10.00	\$38.00
<b>Trace Analytical Laboratories, Inc.</b> 2241 Black Creek Rd Muskegon, MI 49444		\$35.00	\$175.00	\$20.00	\$25.00	\$50.00
		\$36.00	\$178.00	\$21.00	\$26.00	\$51.00
		\$37.00	\$182.00	\$22.00	\$27.00	\$52.00
		\$28.00				
		\$43.00	No Bid	\$11.50	\$11.50	\$66.00
		\$29.00				
		\$44.00	No Bid	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$68.00
		\$30.00				
		\$45.00	No Bid	\$12.50	\$12.50	\$70.00

# BID TAB

<b>Bid File: #961-48-72</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: June 05, 2024</b> <b>For: Lab Analysis Services - General</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 104</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: ESD</b>		<b>ITEM 21</b>	<b>ITEM 22</b>	<b>ITEM 23</b>	<b>ITEM 24</b>	<b>ITEM 25</b>
		<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>
		<b>Nitrogen Ammonia</b>	<b>Nitrogen Nitrate</b>	<b>Nitrogen Nitrite</b>	<b>Nitrogen Total</b>	<b>Oil &amp; Grease HEM</b>
		<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>Kjeldahl \$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>Eurofins Environment Testing North Central, LLC</b> 4595 Broadmoor Ave SE, Ste 195 Grand Rapids, MI 49512		\$15.00			\$18.00	
		\$31.00	\$11.00	\$11.00	\$35.00	\$27.00
		\$15.00			\$18.00	
		\$31.00	\$11.00	\$11.00	\$35.00	\$27.00
		\$15.00			\$18.00	
<b>RTI Laboratories</b> 31628 Glendale St Livonia, MI 48150		\$30.00				
		\$40.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$50.00	\$45.00
		\$31.00				
		\$41.00	\$21.00	\$21.00	\$51.00	\$46.00
		\$32.00				
<b>Trace Analytical Laboratories, Inc.</b> 2241 Black Creek Rd Muskegon, MI 49444		\$42.00	\$22.00	\$22.00	\$52.00	\$47.00
		\$16.50				
		\$28.00	\$11.50	\$11.50	\$18.50	\$23.00
		\$17.00				
		\$29.00	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$19.00	\$24.00
		\$17.50				
		\$30.00	\$12.50	\$12.50	\$19.50	\$25.00

# BID TAB

<b>Bid File: #961-48-72</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: June 05, 2024</b> <b>For: Lab Analysis Services - General</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 104</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: ESD</b>		<b>ITEM 26</b>	<b>ITEM 27</b>	<b>ITEM 28</b>	<b>ITEM 29</b>	<b>ITEM 30</b>
		<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>
		<b>Oil &amp; Grease SGT-HEM</b>	<b>pH measured onsite</b>	<b>Phosphorus Total</b>	<b>Phosphorus Ortho</b>	<b>Phenolic Compounds</b>
		<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>Total \$/Ea.</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>Eurofins Environment Testing North Central, LLC</b> 4595 Broadmoor Ave SE, Ste 195 Grand Rapids, MI 49512		\$180.00	No Bid	\$17.00 \$31.00	\$16.00	\$20.00 \$45.00
		\$80.00	No Bid	\$17.00 \$31.00	\$16.00	\$20.00 \$45.00
		\$80.00	No Bid	\$17.00 \$31.00	\$16.00	\$20.00 \$45.00
		\$80.00	No Bid	\$17.00 \$31.00	\$16.00	\$20.00 \$45.00
<b>RTI Laboratories</b> 31628 Glendale St Livonia, MI 48150		\$55.00	\$15.00	\$30.00	\$30.00	\$45.00
		\$56.00	\$16.00	\$31.00	\$31.00	\$46.00
		\$57.00	\$17.00	\$32.00	\$32.00	\$47.00
<b>Trace Analytical Laboratories, Inc.</b> 2241 Black Creek Rd Muskegon, MI 49444		\$45.00	\$6.00	\$11.50	\$11.50	\$25.00
		\$46.00	\$6.50	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$26.00
		\$47.00	\$7.00	\$12.50	\$12.50	\$27.00

# BID TAB

<b>Bid File: #961-48-72</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: June 05, 2024</b> <b>For: Lab Analysis Services - General</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 104</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: ESD</b>		<b>ITEM 31</b>	<b>ITEM 32</b>	<b>ITEM 33</b>	<b>ITEM 34</b>	<b>ITEM 35</b>
		<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>
		<b>Sulfides</b>	<b>Sulfur Total</b>	<b>Sulfates</b>	<b>Sulfites</b>	<b>Total Organic Carbon</b>
		<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>Eurofins Environment Testing North Central, LLC</b> 4595 Broadmoor Ave SE, Ste 195 Grand Rapids, MI 49512		\$21.00	\$35.00	\$11.00	\$34.00	\$23.00
					\$35.00	\$75.00
		\$21.00	\$35.00	\$11.00	\$34.00	\$23.00
					\$35.00	\$75.00
<b>RTI Laboratories</b> 31628 Glendale St Livonia, MI 48150		\$30.00	\$75.00	\$20.00	\$35.00	\$50.00
				\$30.00	\$40.00	\$65.00
		\$31.00	\$76.00	\$21.00	\$36.00	\$51.00
				\$31.00	\$41.00	\$66.00
<b>Trace Analytical Laboratories, Inc.</b> 2241 Black Creek Rd Muskegon, MI 49444		\$32.00	\$77.00	\$22.00	\$37.00	\$52.00
				\$32.00	\$42.00	\$67.00
		\$23.00	\$11.50	\$11.50	\$23.00	\$23.00
						\$38.00
		\$24.00	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$24.00	\$24.00
						\$39.00
		\$25.00	\$12.50	\$12.50	\$25.00	\$25.00
						\$40.00

# BID TAB

<b>Bid File: #961-48-72</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: June 05, 2024</b> <b>For: Lab Analysis Services - General</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 104</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: ESD</b>		<b>ITEM 36</b>	<b>ITEM 37</b>	<b>ITEM 38</b>	<b>ITEM 39</b>	<b>ITEM 40</b>
		<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>
		<b>Total Dissolved Solids</b>	<b>Total Suspended Solids</b>	<b>Volatile Suspended Solids</b>	<b>Total Solids by weight</b>	<b>Volatile Solids by weight</b>
		<b>TDS \$/Ea.</b>	<b>TSS \$/Ea.</b>	<b>VSS \$/Ea.</b>	<b>TS \$/Ea.</b>	<b>VS \$/Ea.</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>Eurofins Environment Testing North Central, LLC</b> 4595 Broadmoor Ave SE, Ste 195 Grand Rapids, MI 49512		\$10.00	\$10.00	\$40.00	\$10.00	\$25.00
		\$10.00	\$10.00	\$40.00	\$10.00	\$25.00
		\$10.00	\$10.00	\$40.00	\$10.00	\$25.00
<b>RTI Laboratories</b> 31628 Glendale St Livonia, MI 48150		\$25.00	\$25.00	\$38.00	\$30.00	\$35.00
		\$26.00	\$26.00	\$39.00	\$31.00	\$36.00
		\$27.00	\$27.00	\$40.00	\$32.00	\$37.00
<b>Trace Analytical Laboratories, Inc.</b> 2241 Black Creek Rd Muskegon, MI 49444		\$11.50	\$11.50	\$11.50	\$7.00	\$11.50
		\$12.00	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$7.50	\$12.00
		\$12.50	\$12.50	\$12.50	\$8.00	\$12.50



# BID TAB

<b>Bid File: #961-48-72</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: June 05, 2024</b> <b>For: Lab Analysis Services - General</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 104</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: ESD</b>		<b>ITEM 41</b>	<b>ITEM 42</b>	<b>ITEM 43</b>	<b>ITEM 44</b>	<b>ITEM 45</b>
		<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>
		<b>Total Solids by volume</b>	<b>Turbidity</b>	<b>Metals Total</b>	<b>Mercury Total</b>	<b>Low-Level Mercury</b>
		<b>TS by Volume \$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>ng/L detection limit \$/Ea.</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>Eurofins Environment Testing North Central, LLC</b> 4595 Broadmoor Ave SE, Ste 195 Grand Rapids, MI 49512		\$10.00	\$10.00	Tiered Pricing	\$18.00 \$20.00	\$70.00
		\$10.00	\$10.00	Tiered Pricing	\$18.00 \$20.00	\$70.00
		\$10.00	\$10.00	Tiered Pricing	\$18.00 \$20.00	\$70.00
<b>RTI Laboratories</b> 31628 Glendale St Livonia, MI 48150		\$30.00	\$15.00	Tiered Pricing	\$35.00 \$40.00	\$135.00
		\$31.00	\$16.00	Tiered Pricing	\$36.00 \$41.00	\$138.00
		\$32.00	\$17.00	Tiered Pricing	\$37.00 \$42.00	\$140.00
<b>Trace Analytical Laboratories, Inc.</b> 2241 Black Creek Rd Muskegon, MI 49444		No Bid	\$11.50	Tiered Pricing	\$20.00	\$56.00
		No Bid	\$12.00	Tiered Pricing	\$21.00	\$58.00
		No Bid	\$12.50	Tiered Pricing	\$22.00	\$60.00

# BID TAB

<b>Bid File: #961-48-72</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: June 05, 2024</b> <b>For: Lab Analysis Services - General</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 104</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: ESD</b>		<b>ITEM 46</b>	<b>ITEM 47</b>	<b>ITEM 48</b>	<b>ITEM 49</b>	<b>ITEM 50</b>
		<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>
		<b>Volatile Organic Analysis</b>	<b>Pesticides</b>	<b>PCB's</b>	<b>BTEX/MTBE</b>	<b>Benzidines</b>
		<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>Eurofins Environment Testing North Central, LLC</b> 4595 Broadmoor Ave SE, Ste 195 Grand Rapids, MI 49512		\$60.00	\$95.00	\$50.00 \$52.00	\$40.00 \$45.00	\$207.00
		\$60.00	\$95.00	\$50.00 \$52.00	\$40.00 \$45.00	\$207.00
		\$60.00	\$95.00	\$50.00 \$52.00	\$40.00 \$45.00	\$207.00
<b>RTI Laboratories</b> 31628 Glendale St Livonia, MI 48150		\$115.00	\$145.00	\$90.00	\$50.00	\$145.00
		\$117.00	\$148.00	\$92.00	\$51.00	\$148.00
		\$120.00	\$151.00	\$94.00	\$52.00	\$151.00
<b>Trace Analytical Laboratories, Inc.</b> 2241 Black Creek Rd Muskegon, MI 49444		\$48.00			\$48.00	
		\$56.00	\$64.00	\$64.00	\$56.00	\$162.00
		\$49.00			\$49.00	
		\$58.00	\$66.00	\$66.00	\$58.00	\$164.00
		\$50.00			\$50.00	
		\$60.00	\$68.00	\$68.00	\$60.00	\$166.00

# BID TAB

<b>Bid File: #961-48-72</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: June 05, 2024</b> <b>For: Lab Analysis Services - General</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 104</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: ESD</b>		<b>ITEM 51</b>	<b>ITEM 52</b>	<b>ITEM 53</b>	<b>ITEM 54</b>
		<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>
		<b>Chlorinated Hydrocarbons</b>	<b>Dioxins</b>	<b>Alcohols &amp; Glycols Individual</b>	<b>Formaldehyde</b>
		<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>				
	<b>Year 2</b>				
	<b>Year 3</b>				
<b>Eurofins Environment Testing North Central, LLC</b> 4595 Broadmoor Ave SE, Ste 195 Grand Rapids, MI 49512		\$650.00	\$480.00	\$140.00	\$150.00
		\$650.00	\$480.00	\$140.00	\$150.00
		\$650.00	\$480.00	\$140.00	\$150.00
<b>RTI Laboratories</b> 31628 Glendale St Livonia, MI 48150		\$115.00	\$500.00	\$100.00	\$245.00
		\$117.00	\$510.00	\$102.00	\$250.00
		\$120.00	\$520.00	\$104.00	\$255.00
<b>Trace Analytical Laboratories, Inc.</b> 2241 Black Creek Rd Muskegon, MI 49444		\$86.00	No Bid	\$56.00	\$28.00
		\$88.00	No Bid	\$58.00	\$29.00
		\$90.00	No Bid	\$60.00	\$30.00

# BID TAB

<b>Bid File: #961-48-72</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: June 05, 2024</b> <b>For: Lab Analysis Services - General</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 104</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: ESD</b>		<b>ITEM 55</b>	<b>ITEM 56</b>	<b>ITEM 57</b>	<b>ITEM 58</b>	<b>ITEM 59</b>
		<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>
		<b>Paint Filter Test</b>	<b>Flash Point</b>	<b>Volatile Fatty Acids</b>	<b>Specific Gravity</b>	<b>Purgeable Organics</b>
		<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>Eurofins Environment Testing North Central, LLC</b> 4595 Broadmoor Ave SE, Ste 195 Grand Rapids, MI 49512		\$10.00	\$30.00	\$160.00	\$12.00	\$100.00
		\$10.00	\$30.00	\$160.00	\$12.00	\$100.00
		\$10.00	\$30.00	\$160.00	\$12.00	\$100.00
<b>RTI Laboratories</b> 31628 Glendale St Livonia, MI 48150		\$25.00	\$30.00	\$275.00	\$20.00	\$125.00
		\$26.00	\$31.00	\$280.00	\$21.00	\$127.00
		\$27.00	\$32.00	\$286.00	\$22.00	\$130.00
<b>Trace Analytical Laboratories, Inc.</b> 2241 Black Creek Rd Muskegon, MI 49444		\$9.00	\$23.00	\$86.00	\$16.50	\$48.00
		\$9.50	\$24.00	\$88.00	\$17.00	\$49.00
		\$10.00	\$25.00	\$90.00	\$17.50	\$50.00

# BID TAB

<b>Bid File: #961-48-72</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: June 05, 2024</b> <b>For: Lab Analysis Services - General</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 104</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: ESD</b>		<b>ITEM 60</b>	<b>ITEM 61</b>	<b>ITEM 62</b>	<b>ITEM 63</b>	<b>ITEM 64</b>
		<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>
		<b>Volatile Organics</b> <b>in Pharmaceuticals</b>	<b>Ultimate Bio-chemical</b> <b>Oxygen Demand</b>	<b>2, 3, 7, 8-TCCD</b> <b>Quantified</b>	<b>2, 3, 7, 8-TCCD</b> <b>Screening</b>	<b>Semi-Volatile</b> <b>Organic Analysis</b>
		<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>BOD7</b> <b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>Eurofins Environment Testing North Central, LLC</b> 4595 Broadmoor Ave SE, Ste 195 Grand Rapids, MI 49512		\$700.00	\$80.00	\$450.00	\$100.00	\$125.00
						\$130.00
		\$700.00	\$80.00	\$450.00	\$100.00	\$125.00
						\$130.00
<b>RTI Laboratories</b> 31628 Glendale St Livonia, MI 48150		\$300.00	\$160.00	\$500.00	\$165.00	\$175.00
		\$306.00	\$163.00	\$510.00	\$168.00	\$178.00
		\$312.00	\$166.00	\$520.00	\$171.00	\$182.00
<b>Trace Analytical Laboratories, Inc.</b> 2241 Black Creek Rd Muskegon, MI 49444		\$48.00	\$23.00	No Bid	\$106.00	\$106.00
						\$137.00
		\$49.00	\$24.00	No Bid	\$108.00	\$108.00
						\$139.00
		\$50.00	\$25.00	No Bid	\$110.00	\$110.00
						\$141.00

# BID TAB

<b>Bid File: #961-48-72</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: June 05, 2024</b> <b>For: Lab Analysis Services - General</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 104</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: ESD</b>		<b>ITEM 65</b>	<b>ITEM 66</b>	<b>ITEM 67</b>	<b>ITEM 68</b>	<b>ITEM 69</b>
		<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>
		<b>TENORM</b>	<b>Semi-Volatile Fingerprint</b>	<b>TCLP Extraction</b>	<b>TCLP Extraction Zero Head Space</b>	<b>Asbestos</b>
		<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>	<b>\$/Ea.</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>Eurofins Environment Testing North Central, LLC</b> 4595 Broadmoor Ave SE, Ste 195 Grand Rapids, MI 49512		\$100.00	No Bid	\$30.00	\$30.00	\$155.00
		\$100.00	No Bid	\$30.00	\$30.00	\$155.00
		\$100.00	No Bid	\$30.00	\$30.00	\$155.00
<b>RTI Laboratories</b> 31628 Glendale St Livonia, MI 48150		\$195.00	\$175.00	\$40.00	\$40.00	\$225.00
		\$199.00	\$178.00	\$41.00	\$41.00	\$230.00
		\$203.00	\$182.00	\$42.00	\$42.00	\$235.00
<b>Trace Analytical Laboratories, Inc.</b> 2241 Black Creek Rd Muskegon, MI 49444		\$252.00	\$130.00	\$33.00	\$38.00	No Bid
		\$254.00	\$132.00	\$34.00	\$39.00	No Bid
		\$256.00	\$134.00	\$35.00	\$40.00	No Bid

# BID TAB

<b>Bid File: #961-48-72</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: June 05, 2024</b> <b>For: Lab Analysis Services - General</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 104</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: ESD</b>		<b>ITEM 70</b>	<b>ITEM 71</b>	<b>ITEM 72</b>	<b>ITEM 73</b>	<b>ITEM 74</b>
		<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>	<b>Testing Services</b>
		<b>Additional Monitoring</b>	<b>Expedited Response</b>	<b>Emergency Response</b>	<b>Scheduled Response</b>	<b>Emergency Response</b>
		<b>Requirement AMR \$/Ea.</b>	<b>5 Days %/Ea</b>	<b>2 Days %/Ea</b>	<b>24 Hour %/Ea</b>	<b>24 Hour %/Ea</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>Eurofins Environment Testing North Central, LLC</b> 4595 Broadmoor Ave SE, Ste 195 Grand Rapids, MI 49512		\$1,937.00	30%	100%	200%	250%
			30%	100%	200%	250%
			30%	100%	200%	250%
<b>RTI Laboratories</b> 31628 Glendale St Livonia, MI 48150		\$580.00	50%	90%	100%	200%
			50%	90%	100%	200%
			50%	90%	100%	200%
<b>Trace Analytical Laboratories, Inc.</b> 2241 Black Creek Rd Muskegon, MI 49444			50%	100%	150%	200%
			50%	100%	150%	200%
			50%	100%	150%	200%

# BID TAB

<b>Bid File: #961-48-72</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: June 05, 2024</b> <b>For: Lab Analysis Services - General</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 104</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: ESD</b>	
	<b>Year 1</b>
	<b>Year 2</b>
	<b>Year 3</b>
<b>Eurofins Environment Testing North Central, LLC</b> 4595 Broadmoor Ave SE, Ste 195 Grand Rapids, MI 49512	0
<b>RTI Laboratories</b> 31628 Glendale St Livonia, MI 48150	
<b>Trace Analytical Laboratories, Inc.</b> 2241 Black Creek Rd Muskegon, MI 49444	