

BID TAB

Bid File #988-52-65 Bid Opening Date: January 2, 2025 For: Landscape Maintenance Services # Bidders Solicited: 459 Buyer: Jeffrey Poil Dept: Various	ITEM 50 Section F: ESD Fertilizer, Weed Control - 1300 Market/740 Market \$/Year	ITEM 51 Section F: ESD Fertilizer, Weed Control 600 Market \$/Year	ITEM 52 Section F: ESD Grub Control 1300 Market/ 740 Market \$/Year	ITEM 115 Section I: Addtl Services Ortho TrioX Applied \$/Ln. Ft.	ITEM 116 Section I: Addtl Services Ortho TrioX Applied \$/Sq. Ft.	ITEM 117 Section I: Addtl Services Roundup Applied \$/Ln. Ft.	ITEM 118 Section I: Addtl Services Roundup Applied \$/Sq. Ft.
Everett's Landscape 7884 Eastern Ave SE Grand Rapids, MI 49508	\$1,942.20	\$475.45	\$324.56	\$0.10	\$0.20	\$0.06	\$0.08
	\$2,000.46	\$489.72	\$334.30	\$0.10	\$0.20	\$0.06	\$0.08
	\$2,060.48	\$504.41	\$344.32	\$0.10	\$0.20	\$0.06	\$0.08
Shawn Sremba dba Natural Landscapes LLC 8830 Belding Road, Suite B Rockford, MI 49341	\$3,150.00	\$480.00	\$690.00	\$0.10	\$0.20	\$0.10	\$0.10
	\$3,150.00	\$480.00	\$690.00	\$0.10	\$0.20	\$0.10	\$0.10
	\$3,150.00	\$480.00	\$690.00	\$0.10	\$0.20	\$0.10	\$0.10
Prominent Property Services 901 Evergreen Grand Rapids, MI 49507	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Vigh Landscape Management 2851 Three Mile Road NW Grand Rapids, MI 49534	\$4,900.00	\$650.00	\$1,150.00	\$0.10	\$0.11	\$0.08	\$0.11
	\$4,900.00	\$650.00	\$1,150.00	\$0.10	\$0.11	\$0.08	\$0.11
	\$4,900.00	\$650.00	\$1,150.00	\$0.10	\$0.11	\$0.08	\$0.11
Weed and Feed Lawn Care LLC 8808 Eastern Avenue SE Byron Center, MI 49315	\$2,561.00	\$266.00	\$762.00	\$0.08	\$0.10	\$0.06	\$0.08
	\$2,561.00	\$266.00	\$762.00	\$0.08	\$0.10	\$0.06	\$0.08
	\$2,561.00	\$266.00	\$762.00	\$0.08	\$0.10	\$0.06	\$0.08

BID TAB

Bid File #988-52-65 Bid Opening Date: January 2, 2025 For: Landscape Maintenance Services # Bidders Solicited: 459 Buyer: Jeffrey Poll Dept: Various	ITEM 119	
	Section I: Add'l	
	Add'l Services	
	Grub Control	
Year 1 Year 2 Year 3	\$/Sq. Ft.	
Everett's Landscape 7884 Eastern Ave SE Grand Rapids, MI 49508	\$0.03	
	\$0.04	
	\$0.05	
Shawn Sremba dba Natural Landscapes LLC 8830 Belding Road, Suite B Rockford, MI 49341	\$0.08	
	\$0.08	
	\$0.08	
Prominent Property Services 901 Evergreen Grand Rapids, MI 49507	No Bid	
	No Bid	
	No Bid	
Vigh Landscape Management 2851 Three Mile Road NW Grand Rapids, MI 49534	\$0.03	
	\$0.03	
	\$0.03	
Weed and Feed Lawn Care LLC 8808 Eastern Avenue SE Byron Center, MI 49315	\$0.01	
	\$0.01	
	\$0.01	