BID TAB Page 1 of 14
BID FILE #928-82-12 TTEM 1 TTEM 2 TEM 3 TTEM 4 TTEM 5
BID OPENING DATE: October 11, 2024 Section I-Fire Section I-Fire Section I-Fire Section I-Fire Section I-Fire
FOR: Tire Mounting Services Tire, Retread, Tire, Retread, Tire, New Tire, New Tire, New
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 58 Using City Casings Using City Casings Goodyear Goodyear Goodyear
BUYER: DW Goodyear, G372 12 R 22.5 | Goodyear, G6222 12 R 22.5 | G286 385 X 65 R 22.5 | G286 425 X 65 R 22.5 | G622 12 R 22.5
DEPT: Fleet, Fire $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
$190.93 $206.96 $555.83 $594.50 $609.87
K&R Tire and Trailer
892 Interchange Dr $190.93 $206.96 $566.95 $606.39 $622.07
Holland, Michigan
$190.93 $206.96 $578.29 $618.52 $634.51
$190.93 $206.96 $783.38 $804.14 $609.87
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company
1228 Ingle Road $200.48 $217.31 Net State Net State Net State
Wayland, Ml 49348
$210.50 $228.18 Net State Net State Net State
$225.00 $225.00 $725.00 $820.00 $627.00
Meekhof Tire Sales & Service, Inc.
16440 Olson NE $225.00 $225.00 $725.00 $820.00 $627.00
Grand Rapids, Ml 49503
$225.00 $225.00 $725.00 $820.00 $627.00
$232.89 $230.15 $602.78 $690.40 $479.59
ATS Fleet Service
4525 Clyde Park Ave SW $232.89 $230.15 $602.78 $690.40 $479.59
Grand Rapids, Ml
$232.89 $230.15 $602.78 $690.40 $479.59




Page 2 of 14

BID FILE #928-82-12 TTEM 6 TTEM 7 TTEM 8 TTEM 9 TTEM 10
BID OPENING DATE: October 11, 2024 Section I-Fire Section I-Fire Section I-Fire Section I-Fire Section I-Fire
FOR: Tire Mounting Services Vendor Location | Vendor Location Vendor Location Vendor Location Vendor Location
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 58 Tire Mounting/ Wheel Change Rim & Wheel Disposal of Unusable Flat Tire
BUYER: DW Dismounting Service Recondition/Refurb Tire Castings Repair
DEPT: Fleet, Fire $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
$20.00 $20.00 $35.00 $15.00 $55.00
K&R Tire and Trailer
892 Interchange Dr $20.00 $20.00 $35.00 $15.00 $55.00
Holland, Michigan
$20.00 $20.00 $35.00 $15.00 $55.00
$32.50 $32.50 $49.00 $15.00 $48.00
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company
1228 Ingle Road $34.13 $34.13 $49.00 $15.00 $48.00
Wayland, Ml 49348
$35.83 $35.83 $49.00 $15.00 $48.00
$24.00 $24.00 $32.00 $12.00 $35.00
Meekhof Tire Sales & Service, Inc.
16440 Olson NE $24.00 $24.00 $32.00 $12.00 $35.00
Grand Rapids, Ml 49503
$24.00 $24.00 $32.00 $12.00 $35.00
$20.00 $20.00 $37.00 $9.00 $35.00
ATS Fleet Service
4525 Clyde Park Ave SW $20.00 $20.00 $37.00 $9.00 $35.00
Grand Rapids, Ml
$20.00 $20.00 $37.00 $9.00 $35.00




BID TAB Page 3 of 14
BID FILE #928-82-12 TTEM 11 TTEM 12 TTEM 13 TTEM 14 TTEM 15 TTEM 16
BID OPENING DATE: October 11, 2024 Section I-Fire Section I-Fire | Section I-Fire Section I-Fire Section I-Fire | Section I-Fire
FOR: Tire Mounting Services Vendor Location Fire Stations Fire Stations Fire Stations Fire Stations | Fire Stations
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 58 Tire Tire Mounting/ | Wheel Change | Disposal of Unusable Flat Tire Tire
BUYER: DW Inspection Dismounting Service Tire Castings Repair Inspection
DEPT: Fleet, Fire $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each $/Each
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
$0.00 $20.00 $20.00 $15.00 $52.00 $0.00
K&R Tire and Trailer
892 Interchange Dr $0.00 $20.00 $20.00 $15.00 $52.00 $0.00
Holland, Michigan
$0.00 $20.00 $20.00 $15.00 $52.00 $0.00
$75.00 $42.50 $42.50 $15.00 $58.00 $85.00
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company
1228 Ingle Road $75.00 $42.50 $42.50 $15.00 $58.00 $85.00
Wayland, Ml 49348
$75.00 $42.50 $42.50 $15.00 $58.00 $85.00
$0.00 $30.00 $30.00 $12.00 $35.00 $0.00
Meekhof Tire Sales & Service, Inc.
16440 Olson NE $0.00 $30.00 $30.00 $12.00 $35.00 $0.00
Grand Rapids, Ml 49503
$0.00 $30.00 $30.00 $12.00 $35.00 $0.00
$0.00 $20.00 $20.00 $9.00 $35.00 $0.00
ATS Fleet Service
4525 Clyde Park Ave SW $0.00 $20.00 $20.00 $9.00 $35.00 $0.00
Grand Rapids, Ml
$0.00 $20.00 $20.00 $9.00 $35.00 $0.00
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BID FILE #928-82-12 TTEM 17 TTEM 18 TTEM 19 TTEM 20 TTEM 21 TTEM 22
BID OPENING DATE: October 11, 2024 Section I-Fire Section |l Section I Section |l Section |l Section Il
FOR: Tire Mounting Services Fire Stations Retread Retread Retread Retread Cap
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 58 Emergency/Rush Goodyear G1362 Goodyear G692 |Bandag BDR-HT3| Goodyear G292 | oddyear G292
BUYER: DW Wheel Change or XDAHT or XDUS or Equivalent or XDUS On conuster care
DEPT: Fleet, Fire $/Each $Each $Each $Each $Each

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

$0.00 $203.62 $275.00 $188.19 $260.00 $188.19

K&R Tire and Trailer
892 Interchange Dr $0.00 $203.62 $275.00 $188.19 $260.00 $188.19
Holland, Michigan

$0.00 $203.62 $275.00 $188.19 $260.00 $188.19

$75.00 $188.19 $272.27 $151.47 $272.27 $188.19

The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company
1228 Ingle Road $75.00 $197.60 $285.88 $159.04 $285.88 $197.60
Wayland, Ml 49348

$75.00 $207.48 $300.18 $166.99 $300.18 $207.48

$0.00 $220.00 $300.00 $220.00 $290.00 No bid

Meekhof Tire Sales & Service, Inc.
16440 Olson NE $0.00 $220.00 $300.00 $220.00 $290.00 No bid
Grand Rapids, Ml 49503

$0.00 $220.00 $300.00 $220.00 $290.00 No bid

$105.00 $205.15 $230.84 $238.17 $230.84 $205.15

ATS Fleet Service
4525 Clyde Park Ave SW $105.00 $205.15 $230.84 $238.17 $230.84 $205.15
Grand Rapids, Ml

$105.00 $205.15 $230.84 $238.17 $230.84 $205.15
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BID FILE #928-82-12 ITEM 23 TTEM 24 TTEM 25 TTEM 26 TTEM 27 TTEM 28 TTEM 29
BID OPENING DATE: October 11, 2024 Section |l Section |l Section Il Section I Section |l Section |l Section |l
FOR: Tire Mounting Services Retread/Cap Retread/Cap Retread/Cap Retread/Cap Retread/Cap Retread/Cap Retread/Cap
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 58 Repair - Cap Repair - Cap | Repair- Cap | Repair - Section | Repair - Section | Repair - Section | Repair - Bead
BUYER: DW Spot, Small | Spot, Medium | Spot, Large Small Medium Large Small
DEPT: Fleet, Fire $Each $Each $Each $Each $Each $Each $Each
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
$19.74 $19.74 $19.74 $28.00 $49.00 $75.32 $17.34
K&R Tire and Trailer
892 Interchange Dr $19.74 $19.74 $19.74 $28.00 $49.00 $75.32 $17.34
Holland, Michigan
$19.74 $19.74 $19.74 $28.00 $49.00 $75.32 $17.34
$10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $18.50 $18.50 $18.50 $10.00
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company
1228 Ingle Road $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $18.50 $18.50 $18.50 $10.00
Wayland, Ml 49348
$10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $18.50 $18.50 $18.50 $10.00
$5.00 $5.00 $7.00 $20.00 $30.00 $40.00 $10.00
Meekhof Tire Sales & Service, Inc.
16440 Olson NE $5.00 $5.00 $7.00 $20.00 $30.00 $40.00 $10.00
Grand Rapids, Ml 49503
$5.00 $5.00 $7.00 $20.00 $30.00 $40.00 $10.00
$10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $36.00 $54.00 $65.00 $17.00
ATS Fleet Service
4525 Clyde Park Ave SW $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $36.00 $54.00 $65.00 $17.00
Grand Rapids, Ml
$10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $36.00 $54.00 $65.00 $17.00
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BID FILE #928-82-12 TTEM 30 TTEM 31 TTEM 32 TTEM 33 TTEM 34 TTEM 35
BID OPENING DATE: October 11, 2024 Section Il Section |l Section |l Section |l Section Il Section Il
FOR: Tire Mounting Services Retread/Cap Retread/Cap Retread/Cap Retread/Cap Retread/Cap Veh. Location - Tire
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 58 Repair - Bead | Repair - Bead | Repair - Nail Repair - Nail Repair - Nail Mounting/Dismounting
BUYER: DW Medium Large Hole - Small Hole - Medium Hole - Large Passenger/Lgt Truck
DEPT: Fleet, Fire $Each $Each $Each $Each $Each $Each
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
$17.34 $17.34 $8.47 $15.12 $17.36 $10.00
K&R Tire and Trailer
892 Interchange Dr $17.34 $17.34 $8.47 $15.12 $17.36 $10.00
Holland, Michigan
$17.34 $17.34 $8.47 $15.12 $17.36 $10.00
$10.00 $10.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $24.00
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company
1228 Ingle Road $10.00 $10.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $25.20
Wayland, Ml 49348
$10.00 $10.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $26.46
$15.00 $15.00 $5.00 $10.00 $15.00 $28.00
Meekhof Tire Sales & Service, Inc.
16440 Olson NE $15.00 $15.00 $5.00 $10.00 $15.00 $28.00
Grand Rapids, Ml 49503
$15.00 $15.00 $5.00 $10.00 $15.00 $28.00
$17.00 $17.00 $10.00 $10.00 $18.00 $19.00
ATS Fleet Service
4525 Clyde Park Ave SW $17.00 $17.00 $10.00 $10.00 $18.00 $19.00
Grand Rapids, Ml
$17.00 $17.00 $10.00 $10.00 $18.00 $19.00
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BID FILE #928-82-12 TTEM 36 TTEM 37 ITEM 38 TTEM 39 TTEM 40
BID OPENING DATE: October 11, 2024 Section Il Section Il Section Il Section Il Section Il
FOR: Tire Mounting Services Veh. Location - Tire Veh. Location - Tire Vehicle Location | Veh. Location - Flat | Veh. Location - Flat
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 58 Mounting/Dismounting Mounting/Dismounting Wheel Change Tire Repair Tire Repair
BUYER: DW Truck Tires Off Road Tires Service Passenger Veh Medium Truck
DEPT: Fleet, Fire $Each $Each $Each $Each $Each
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
$20.00 No Bid $10.00 $30.00 $62.00
K&R Tire and Trailer
892 Interchange Dr $20.00 No Bid $10.00 $30.00 $62.00
Holland, Michigan
$20.00 No Bid $10.00 $30.00 $62.00
$44.00 No Bid $20.00 $22.00 $48.00
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company
1228 Ingle Road $46.20 No Bid $20.00 $22.00 $48.00
Wayland, Ml 49348
$48.51 No Bid $20.00 $22.00 $48.00
$30.00 $50.00 $30.00 $25.00 $35.00
Meekhof Tire Sales & Service, Inc.
16440 Olson NE $30.00 $50.00 $30.00 $25.00 $35.00
Grand Rapids, Ml 49503
$30.00 $50.00 $30.00 $25.00 $35.00
$20.00 $130.00 $20.00 $23.00 $35.00
ATS Fleet Service
4525 Clyde Park Ave SW $20.00 $130.00 $20.00 $23.00 $35.00
Grand Rapids, Ml
$20.00 $130.00 $20.00 $23.00 $35.00




BID FILE #928-82-12 TTEM 41 TTEM 42 TTEM 43 TTEM 44
BID OPENING DATE: October 11, 2024 Section Il Section IV Section IV Section IV
FOR: Tire Mounting Services Veh. Location - Flat Vendor Location-Tire Vendor Location-Tire Vendor Location-Tire
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 58 Tire Repair Mounting/Dismounting Mounting/Dismounting Dismounting
BUYER: DW Off Road Tires Passenger/Lgt Truck Truck Tires Off Road Tires
DEPT: Fleet, Fire $Each $Each $Each $Each
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
No Bid $10.00 $20.00 No Bid
K&R Tire and Trailer
892 Interchange Dr No Bid $10.00 $20.00 No Bid
Holland, Michigan
No Bid $10.00 $20.00 No Bid
$250.00 $38.00 $65.00 $250.00
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company
1228 Ingle Road $250.00 $38.00 $65.00 $250.00
Wayland, Ml 49348
$250.00 $38.00 $65.00 $250.00
$100.00 $28.00 $30.00 $50.00
Meekhof Tire Sales & Service, Inc.
16440 Olson NE $100.00 $28.00 $30.00 $50.00
Grand Rapids, Ml 49503
$100.00 $28.00 $30.00 $50.00
$130.00 $9.00 $20.00 $130.00
ATS Fleet Service
4525 Clyde Park Ave SW $130.00 $9.00 $20.00 $130.00
Grand Rapids, Ml
$130.00 $9.00 $20.00 $130.00
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BID FILE #928-82-12 TTEM 45 TTEM 46 TTEM 47 TTEM 48 TTEM 49
BID OPENING DATE: October 11, 2024 Section IV Section IV Section IV Section IV Section IV
FOR: Tire Mounting Services Vendor Location Vendor Location Vendor Location | Vendor Location | Vendor Location
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 58 Wheel Change Reconditioning/ Flat Tire Repair Flat Tire Repair Flat Tire Repair
BUYER: DW Service Refinishing Rim/Wheel Passenger Veh Medium Truck Off Road Tires
DEPT: Fleet, Fire $Each $Each $Each $Each $Each
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
$10.00 $35.00 $30.00 $62.00 No Bid
K&R Tire and Trailer
892 Interchange Dr $10.00 $35.00 $30.00 $62.00 No Bid
Holland, Michigan
$10.00 $35.00 $30.00 $62.00 No Bid
$20.00 $49.00 $22.00 $48.00 $250.00
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company
1228 Ingle Road $20.00 $49.00 $22.00 $48.00 $250.00
Wayland, Ml 49348
$20.00 $49.00 $22.00 $48.00 $250.00
$30.00 $32.00 $25.00 $35.00 $100.00
Meekhof Tire Sales & Service, Inc.
16440 Olson NE $30.00 $32.00 $25.00 $35.00 $100.00
Grand Rapids, Ml 49503
$30.00 $32.00 $25.00 $35.00 $100.00
$20.00 $37.00 $17.00 $30.00 $130.00
ATS Fleet Service
4525 Clyde Park Ave SW $20.00 $37.00 $17.00 $30.00 $130.00
Grand Rapids, Ml
$20.00 $37.00 $17.00 $30.00 $130.00




BID FILE #928-82-12

TTEM 50 TTEM 51 TTEM 52 TTEM 53 TTEM 54
BID OPENING DATE: October 11, 2024 Section IV Section V Section V Section V Section V
Vendor Location Labor Rate Labor Rate Labor Rate Labor Rate - Off

FOR: Tire Mounting Services
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 58
BUYER: DW

Flat Tire Repair

Monday-Friday

Monday-Friday

Sundays/Holidays

Road Tires, M-F

Tire Inspection

7:30 am-4:30 pm

4:30 pm-7:30 am

7:30 am-4:30 pm

DEPT: Fleet, Fire $Each $Hr. $Hr. $Hr. $Hr.
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
$0.00 $90.00 $140.00 $140.00 $125.00
K&R Tire and Trailer
892 Interchange Dr $0.00 $90.00 $140.00 $140.00 $125.00
Holland, Michigan
$0.00 $90.00 $140.00 $140.00 $125.00
$85.00 $164.00 $250.00 $300.00 $300.00
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company
1228 Ingle Road $85.00 $172.50 $250.00 $300.00 $300.00
Wayland, Ml 49348
$85.00 $180.81 $250.00 $300.00 $300.00
$0.00 $80.00 $120.00 $120.00 $90.00
Meekhof Tire Sales & Service, Inc.
16440 Olson NE $0.00 $80.00 $120.00 $120.00 $90.00
Grand Rapids, Ml 49503
$0.00 $80.00 $120.00 $120.00 $90.00
$0.00 $105.00 $138.00 $150.00 $130.00
ATS Fleet Service
4525 Clyde Park Ave SW $0.00 $105.00 $138.00 $150.00 $130.00
Grand Rapids, Ml
$0.00 $105.00 $138.00 $150.00 $130.00
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BID FILE #928-82-12 ITEM 55 TTEM 56 TTEM 57 TTEM 58 TTEM 59 TTEM 60
BID OPENING DATE: October 11, 2024 Section V Section V Section V Section VI-Foam | Section VI-Foam | Section VI-Foam
FOR: Tire Mounting Services Labor Rate - Off Labor Rate - Off Mileage Calls Foam Fill Tires Minimum Foam Pickup/
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 58 Road Tires, M-F Road Tires, outside Fill Charge Delivery Charge
BUYER: DW 4:30 pm-7:30 am | Sundays/Holidays City Limits Per Tire
DEPT: Fleet, Fire $Hr. $Hr. $Mi. $/Lb. $/Ea. $/Ea.

Year 1

Year 2

Year 3

$140.00 $140.00 $1.50 $2.25 $20.00 $0.00

K&R Tire and Trailer
892 Interchange Dr $140.00 $140.00 $1.50 $2.25 $20.00 $0.00
Holland, Michigan

$140.00 $140.00 $1.50 $2.25 $20.00 $0.00

$300.00 $300.00 $3.65 $2.85 $50.00 NC

The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company
1228 Ingle Road $300.00 $300.00 $3.65 $2.95 $50.00 NC
Wayland, Ml 49348

$300.00 $300.00 $3.65 $3.05 $50.00 NC

$130.00 $130.00 $0.00 $1.95 No bid $0.00

Meekhof Tire Sales & Service, Inc.
16440 Olson NE $130.00 $130.00 $0.00 $1.95 No bid $0.00
Grand Rapids, Ml 49503

$130.00 $130.00 $0.00 $1.95 No bid $0.00

$160.00 $175.00 $1.50 $2.15 No bid No bid

ATS Fleet Service
4525 Clyde Park Ave SW $160.00 $175.00 $1.50 $2.15 No bid No bid
Grand Rapids, Ml

$160.00 $175.00 $1.50 $2.15 No bid No bid
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BID FILE #928-82-12 TTEM 61 ITEM 62 TTEM 63 TTEM 64 TTEM 65
BID OPENING DATE: October 11, 2024 Section VI-Foam Section VI-Foam Section VI-Foam Section VII Section VIl
FOR: Tire Mounting Services Wheel Assembly Tire Service Wheel Assembly Tire Disposal- Picked Tire Disposal
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 58 Removal/lnstall Travel Charge Removal/lnstall Up by Vendor Picked Up-Vendor
BUYER: DW At City Location At Vendor Location Passenger Tires Light Truck Tires
DEPT: Fleet, Fire $/Ea. $/Ea. $/Ea. $/Ea. $/Ea.
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 $6.00
K&R Tire and Trailer
892 Interchange Dr No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 $6.00
Holland, Michigan
No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 $6.00
$350.00 $50.00 $300.00 $8.00 $8.00
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company
1228 Ingle Road $350.00 $50.00 $300.00 $8.00 $8.00
Wayland, Ml 49348
$350.00 $50.00 $300.00 $8.00 $8.00
$100.00 $100.00 $50.00 $5.00 $5.00
Meekhof Tire Sales & Service, Inc.
16440 Olson NE $100.00 $100.00 $50.00 $5.00 $5.00
Grand Rapids, Ml 49503
$100.00 $100.00 $50.00 $5.00 $5.00
$130.00 $105.00 $130.00 $4.00 $5.00
ATS Fleet Service
4525 Clyde Park Ave SW $130.00 $105.00 $130.00 $4.00 $5.00
Grand Rapids, Ml
$130.00 $105.00 $130.00 $4.00 $5.00




BID FILE #928-82-12 TTEM 66 TTEM 67 ITEM 68 TTEM 69 TTEM 70 |
BID OPENING DATE: October 11, 2024 Section VII Section VII Section VIII Section VIII Section VIII
FOR: Tire Mounting Services Tire Disposal Tire Disposal Tire Disposal Tire Disposal Tire Disposal
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 58 Picked Up-Vendor Picked Up-Vendor Dropped Off-City Dropped Off-City Dropped Off-City
BUYER: DW Truck Tires Off Road Tires Passenger Tires Light Truck Tires Truck Tires
DEPT: Fleet, Fire $/Ea. $/Ea. $/Ea. $/Ea. $/Ea.
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
$15.00 $70.00 $5.00 $6.00 $15.00
K&R Tire and Trailer
892 Interchange Dr $15.00 $70.00 $5.00 $6.00 $15.00
Holland, Michigan
$15.00 $70.00 $5.00 $6.00 $15.00
$15.00 $30.00 $8.00 $8.00 $15.00
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company
1228 Ingle Road $15.00 $30.00 $8.00 $8.00 $15.00
Wayland, Ml 49348
$15.00 $30.00 $8.00 $8.00 $15.00
$15.00 $100.00 $5.00 $5.00 $15.00
Meekhof Tire Sales & Service, Inc.
16440 Olson NE $15.00 $100.00 $5.00 $5.00 $15.00
Grand Rapids, Ml 49503
$15.00 $100.00 $5.00 $5.00 $15.00
$9.00 $30.00 $4.00 $5.00 $9.00
ATS Fleet Service
4525 Clyde Park Ave SW $9.00 $30.00 $4.00 $5.00 $9.00
Grand Rapids, Ml
$9.00 $30.00 $4.00 $5.00 $9.00
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BID FILE #928-82-12 ITEM 71 ITEM 72 ITEM 73 ITEM 74 |
BID OPENING DATE: October 11, 2024 Section VIII Section IX Section IX Section IX
FOR: Tire Mounting Services Tire Disposal Labor Rate Labor Rate Percent
# BIDDERS SOLICITED: 58 Dropped Off-City Monday-Friday Monday-Friday Discount
BUYER: DW Off Road Tires 7:30 am-4:30 pm | 4:30 pm-7:30 am Catalog
DEPT: Fleet, Fire $/Ea. $/Hr. $/Hr. %
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
$70.00 $90.00 $140.00 No Bid
K&R Tire and Trailer
892 Interchange Dr $70.00 $90.00 $140.00 No Bid
Holland, Michigan
$70.00 $90.00 $140.00 No Bid
$30.00 $200.00 $300.00 0%
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company
1228 Ingle Road $30.00 $200.00 $300.00 0%
Wayland, Ml 49348
$30.00 $200.00 $300.00 0%
$100.00 $90.00 $130.00 10%
Meekhof Tire Sales & Service, Inc.
16440 Olson NE $100.00 $90.00 $130.00 10%
Grand Rapids, Ml 49503
$100.00 $90.00 $130.00 10%
$00.40 Ibs $105.00 $138.00 25%
ATS Fleet Service
4525 Clyde Park Ave SW $00.40 Ibs $105.00 $138.00 25%
Grand Rapids, Ml
$00.40 Ibs $105.00 $138.00 25%
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