

# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 1</b>	<b>ITEM 2</b>	<b>ITEM 3</b>	<b>ITEM 4</b>	<b>ITEM 5</b>
		<b>Labor Costs</b>	<b>BW MicroClip X3</b>	<b>BW GasAlert</b>	<b>Docking Station</b>	<b>Docking Station</b>
		<b>Per Person</b> <b>Per Hour</b>	<b>Personal Detector</b> <b>MCX3-XWHM-Y-NA</b>	<b>MAXXT II</b> <b>Personal Detector</b>	<b>BW IntelliDoX</b> <b>MAXXT</b>	<b>BW IntelliDoX</b> <b>MicroClipXT/L/3</b>
		<b>M-F 7:30am - 4:30pm</b> <b>\$/Hour</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>XT-XWHM-Y-NA</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>DX-MAXXT</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>DX-MCLP</b> <b>\$/Each</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		\$90.00	\$838.41	\$1,071.19	\$2,730.73	\$2,730.73
		\$90.00	\$880.33	\$1,124.75	\$2,867.26	\$2,867.26
		\$90.00	\$924.34	\$1,180.99	\$3,010.63	\$3,010.63
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		\$0.00	\$695.00	\$890.00	\$2,270.00	\$2,270.00
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal

# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 6</b>	<b>ITEM 7</b>	<b>ITEM 8</b>	<b>ITEM 9</b>	<b>ITEM 10</b>
		<b>Kit, Enabler, Dock</b>	<b>Cradle Charger</b>	<b>Regulator, Demand</b>	<b>Calibration Gas</b>	<b>H2S Sensor, BW</b>
		<b>BW IntelliDOX NA Version</b>	<b>BW 5 Instrument MC2-C01-MC5</b>	<b>Flow, Non-Corrosive Air Liquide 2001</b>	<b>4-Blend 58L</b>	<b>GAMC XT SR-H-MC</b>
		<b>DX-ENBL-NA \$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		\$313.72	\$484.00	\$267.48	\$160.00	\$180.40
		\$329.41	\$508.20	\$280.85	\$168.00	\$189.42
		\$345.88	\$533.61	\$294.90	\$176.40	\$198.89
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		\$260.00	\$479.00	\$189.00	\$179.00	\$150.00
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal

# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 11</b>	<b>ITEM 12</b>	<b>ITEM 13</b>	<b>ITEM 14</b>	<b>ITEM 15</b>
		<b>CO Sensor, BW</b>	<b>O2 Sensor, BW</b>	<b>LEL Sensor, BW</b>	<b>Quad Sensor Filter</b>	<b>Sampler Pack, BW</b>
		<b>GAMC XT</b> <b>SR-H-MC</b>	<b>GAMC XT</b> <b>SR-X2V</b>	<b>GAMC XT , Sampler</b> <b>SR-W-MP75C</b>	<b>BW, GAMC XT</b> <b>MC2-SS-KI</b>	<b>GAMC XT Sampler</b> <b>GA-SPAK</b>
		<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>10/pk</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		\$169.40	\$180.40	\$212.30	\$221.10	\$658.90
		\$177.87	\$189.42	\$222.92	\$232.16	\$691.85
		\$186.76	\$198.89	\$234.06	\$243.76	\$726.44
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		\$145.00	\$145.00	\$171.00	\$175.00	No Bid
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal

# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 16</b>	<b>ITEM 17</b>	<b>ITEM 18</b>	<b>ITEM 19</b>	<b>ITEM 20</b>
		<b>Sampler Pump Filters, BW</b>	<b>Front Shell, BW</b>	<b>Rear Shell, BW</b>	<b>Front Shell, BW</b>	<b>Rear Shell, BW</b>
		<b>GAMC XT</b>	<b>GAMC XT</b>	<b>GAMC XT</b>	<b>GAMC XT</b>	<b>GAMC XT</b>
		<b>SP-PF-1</b>	<b>MC2-FC1</b>	<b>MC2-BC1</b>	<b>MC2-FC1</b>	<b>MC2-BC1</b>
		<b>5/pk</b>				
		<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal

# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 21</b>	<b>ITEM 22</b>	<b>ITEM 23</b>	<b>ITEM 24</b>	<b>ITEM 25</b>
		LCD, BW	Particulate Filter	Manual Aspirator	Hydrophobic Filter	Recoil, Tubing Replacement
		GAMC XT MC-LCD-K1	BW, GAMC XT Sampler Hose	Pump Kit, BW GAMC XT	BW, GAMC XT Sampler	BW, GAMC XT Sampler
		\$/Each	D4-PF-1 \$/Each	MC-AS01 \$/Each	D4-WT-1 \$/Each	SP-CT-1 \$/Each
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		No Bid	No Bid	\$168.30	\$49.50	\$97.90
		No Bid	No Bid	\$176.30	\$51.98	\$102.80
		No Bid	No Bid	\$185.55	\$54.57	\$107.93
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$81.40
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal

# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 26</b>	<b>ITEM 27</b>	<b>ITEM 28</b>	<b>ITEM 29</b>
		<b>Regulator, Pressure</b>	<b>Wall Mount for Calibration</b>	<b>Calibration Gas</b>	<b>Labor</b>
		<b>Demand</b>	<b>Gas Cylinder</b>	<b>4-Blend, 58 Liter</b>	<b>Gas Detector</b>
		<b>ReEG-DF-1</b>	<b>MK-CG2-58</b>	<b>Z105325PM59</b>	<b>Calibration/Repairs</b>
		<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>				
	<b>Year 2</b>				
	<b>Year 3</b>				
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		\$691.90	\$180.40	\$158.00	\$90.00
		\$726.50	\$189.42	\$165.90	\$90.00
		\$762.82	\$198.89	\$174.20	\$90.00
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		\$545.00	\$78.00	\$175.00	TBD
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal

# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 30</b>	<b>ITEM 31</b>	<b>ITEM 32</b>	<b>ITEM 33</b>	<b>ITEM 34</b>
		<b>Discount</b>	<b>Honeywell</b>	<b>Honeywell</b>	<b>Honeywell</b>	<b>Honeywell</b>
		<b>BW Parts/Materials</b> <b>Not Listed</b>	<b>50W DC</b> <b>Power Supply</b>	<b>XNX Transmitter</b> <b>#XNX-UTAV-NNNNN</b>	<b>XNX Transmitter</b> <b>w/LEL Sensor</b>	<b>XNX Transmitter</b> <b>w/IR LEL Sensor</b>
		<b>%</b>	<b>#10-0315</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#XNX-UTAV-NNCB1</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#XNX-UTAV-NNIV1</b> <b>\$/Each</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		10.00%	\$982.41	\$1,161.19	\$2,044.25	\$2,813.66
		10.00%	\$1,031.53	\$1,219.25	\$2,146.46	\$2,954.35
		10.00%	\$1,083.10	\$1,280.22	\$2,253.78	\$3,102.06
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		0.00%	\$849.00	\$875.00	\$1,545.00	No Bid
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal

# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 35</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 36</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 37</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 38</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 39</b> <b>Honeywell</b>
		<b>MPD LEL</b> <b>Sensor Assembly</b>	<b>MPD IR LEL</b> <b>Sensor Assembly</b>	<b>MPD LEL</b> <b>Sensor Only</b>	<b>MPD IR LEL</b> <b>Sensor Only</b>	<b>Ferrite Bead</b> <b>#0060-1051</b>
		<b>#MPD-UTCB1</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#MPD-UTIV1</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#1226A0359</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#1226-0299</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		\$1,101.27	\$1,433.69	\$582.29	\$823.13	\$19.00
		\$1,156.33	\$1,505.37	\$611.41	\$864.28	\$19.94
		\$1,214.15	\$1,580.64	\$641.98	\$907.50	\$20.94
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		\$835.00	\$1,085.00	\$439.00	\$625.00	\$14.50
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal



# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 40</b>	<b>ITEM 41</b>	<b>ITEM 42</b>	<b>ITEM 43</b>	<b>ITEM 44</b>
		<b>Honeywell</b>	<b>Honeywell</b>	<b>Honeywell</b>	<b>Honeywell</b>	<b>Honeywell</b>
		<b>3-Wire Junction Box Assembly</b>	<b>MPD IR LEL Sensor Only</b>	<b>Ceiling Mount Bracket</b>	<b>Remote Gassing Kit</b>	<b>Weatherproof Cap, MPD</b>
		<b>#2430-0021</b>	<b>#1226-0299</b>	<b>#1226A0355</b>	<b>#1226A0354</b>	<b>#02000-A-1640</b>
		<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		\$321.11	\$823.13	\$323.17	\$281.54	\$151.51
		\$337.16	\$864.28	\$339.54	\$295.61	\$159.00
		\$354.02	\$907.50	\$356.52	\$310.39	\$167.04
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		\$245.00	\$625.00	\$245.00	\$215.00	\$115.00
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal

# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 45</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 46</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 47</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 48</b> <b>Honeywell</b>
		<b>XNX Transmitter Only</b> <b>#XNX-UTAE-NNNN</b>	<b>XNX Oxygen</b> <b>Sensor Assembly</b> <b>#XNXSO1SS</b>	<b>XNX Hydrogen Sulfide</b> <b>Sensor Assembly</b> <b>#XNXSH2SS</b>	<b>XNX Carbon Monoxide</b> <b>Sensor Assembly</b> <b>#XNXSC1SS</b>
		<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>				
	<b>Year 2</b>				
	<b>Year 3</b>				
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		\$1,619.11	\$710.06	\$710.06	\$710.06
		\$1,700.07	\$745.56	\$745.56	\$745.56
		\$1,785.07	\$782.84	\$782.84	\$782.84
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		\$1,225.00	\$535.00	\$535.00	\$535.00
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal

# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 49</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 50</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 51</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 52</b> <b>Honeywell</b>
		<b>XNX Nitrogen Dioxide</b> <b>Sensor Assembly</b>	<b>Oxygen Plug In</b> <b>Cell, Sensor Only</b>	<b>Hydrogen Sulfide Plug</b> <b>In Cell, Sensor Only</b>	<b>Carbon Monoxide Plug</b> <b>In Cell, Sensor Only</b>
		<b>#XNXSN1SS</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#S3KO1SS</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#S3KH2SS</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#S3KC1SS</b> <b>\$/Each</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>				
	<b>Year 2</b>				
	<b>Year 3</b>				
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		\$1,073.00	\$446.61	\$491.84	\$491.84
		\$1,126.65	\$468.94	\$516.43	\$516.43
		\$1,182.90	\$492.39	\$542.25	\$542.25
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		\$810.00	\$339.00	\$369.00	\$369.00
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal

# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 53</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 54</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 55</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 56</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 57</b> <b>Honeywell</b>
		<b>Nitrogen Dioxide Plug</b> <b>In Cell, Sensor Only</b>	<b>Weather Protection</b> <b>Housing w/Port</b>	<b>XCD LEL</b> <b>Transmitter Only</b>	<b>XCD LEL Transmitter</b> <b>Kit w/Sensor &amp;</b>	<b>XCD LEL</b> <b>Sensor</b>
		<b>#S3KN1SS</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#SPXCDWP</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#SPXCDULNRFD</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>J-Box, #XCDRFDL</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#00705-A-1733</b> <b>\$/Each</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		\$662.57	\$85.86	\$1,109.04	\$2,019.37	\$564.20
		\$695.70	\$90.15	\$1,164.49	\$2,120.34	\$592.41
		\$730.48	\$94.66	\$1,222.72	\$2,226.36	\$622.03
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		\$495.00	\$75.00	\$959.00	\$1,525.00	\$425.00
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal

# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 58</b>	<b>ITEM 59</b>	<b>ITEM 60</b>	<b>ITEM 61</b>	<b>ITEM 62</b>
		<b>Honeywell</b>	<b>Honeywell</b>	<b>Honeywell</b>	<b>Honeywell</b>	<b>Honeywell</b>
		<b>XCD Toxic Transmitter Only</b>	<b>XCD Transmitter w/H2S Sensor</b>	<b>XCD Transmitter w/CO Sensor</b>	<b>XCD Transmitter w/NO2 Sensor</b>	<b>XCD Transmitter w/H2S Sensor &amp; J Box</b>
		<b>#SPXCDULNTX4</b>	<b>#SPXCDULNH2</b>	<b>#SPXCDULNC2</b>	<b>#SPXCDULNN2</b>	<b>#SPXCDULNH2R</b>
		<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>	<b>\$/Each</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		\$1,451.35	\$1,806.52	\$1,806.52	\$1,806.52	\$2,096.40
		\$1,523.92	\$1,896.85	\$1,896.85	\$1,896.85	\$2,201.22
		\$1,600.12	\$1,991.69	\$1,991.69	\$1,991.69	\$2,311.28
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		\$1,255.00	\$1,559.00	\$1,559.00	\$1,559.00	\$1,810.00
	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal
	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal

# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 63</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 64</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 65</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 66</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 67</b> <b>Honeywell</b>
		XCD Transmitter w/ CO Sensor & J Box	XCD Transmitter w/ NO2 Sensor & J Box	XCD Hydrogen Sulfide Assembly	XCD Carbon Monoxide Assembly	XCD Nitrogen Dioxide Assembly
		#SPXCDULNC2R \$/Each	#SPXCDULNN2R \$/Each	#2106B1801 \$/Each	#2106B1806 \$/Each	#2106B1822 \$/Each
	Year 1					
	Year 2					
	Year 3					
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		\$2,096.40	\$2,096.40	\$1,418.99	\$1,418.99	\$1,418.99
		\$2,201.22	\$2,201.22	\$1,489.94	\$1,489.94	\$1,489.94
		\$2,311.28	\$2,311.28	\$1,564.43	\$1,564.43	\$1,564.43
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		\$1,810.00	\$1,810.00	\$1,075.00	\$1,075.00	\$1,075.00
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal

# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 68</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 69</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 70</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 71</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 72</b> <b>Honeywell</b>
		<b>XCD Hydrogen</b> <b>Sulfide Sensor Only</b>	<b>XCD Carbon</b> <b>Monoxide Sensor Only</b>	<b>XCD Nitrogen</b> <b>Dioxide Sensor Only</b>	<b>XCD Weather</b> <b>Housing</b>	<b>XCD Toxic</b> <b>Calibration Kit</b>
		<b>#2106B1549</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#2106B1548</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#2106B1599</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#02000-A-1635</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#2106B2114</b> <b>\$/Each</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		\$932.80	\$932.80	\$932.80	\$125.50	\$479.40
		\$979.44	\$979.44	\$979.44	\$131.78	\$503.37
		\$1,028.41	\$1,028.41	\$1,028.41	\$138.37	\$528.54
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		\$705.00	\$705.00	\$705.00	\$95.00	No Bid
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal

# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 73</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 74</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 75</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 76</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 77</b> <b>Honeywell</b>
		<b>XCD CAL</b> <b>Flow Housing</b>	<b>XCD Transmitter</b> <b>w/O2 Sensor &amp; Housing</b>	<b>XCD Oxygen</b> <b>Sensor Assembly</b>	<b>58L H2S Balance</b> <b>N2 Calibration Gas</b>	<b>103L Zero Air</b> <b>Calibration Gas</b>
		<b>#02000-A-1645</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#SPXCDULNO1</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#SPXCDXSO1SS</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#Z105325PN</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>#ASJ1-3002C</b> <b>\$/Each</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>					
	<b>Year 2</b>					
	<b>Year 3</b>					
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		\$165.08	\$1,741.14	\$719.74	\$158.00	\$158.00
		\$173.33	\$1,828.20	\$755.73	\$165.90	\$165.90
		\$182.00	\$1,919.61	\$793.51	\$174.00	\$174.20
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		\$125.00	\$1,820.00	\$625.00	\$109.00	\$85.00
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal
		at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal	at renewal



# Bid Tabulation

<b>Bid File #345-16-39R</b> <b>Bid Opening Date: April 24, 2025</b> <b>For: Gas Detectors, Personal, Sensors</b> <b># Bidders Solicited: 93</b> <b>Buyer: Jeffrey Poll</b> <b>Dept: Various</b>		<b>ITEM 78</b> <b>Honeywell</b>	<b>ITEM 79</b> <b>Honeywell</b>
		<b>58L H2S 250 PPM</b> <b>Calibration Gas</b>	<b>Discount</b> <b>Controllers/Parts</b>
		<b>#ASZ1-3053250PNC</b> <b>\$/Each</b>	<b>Not Listed</b> <b>%</b>
	<b>Year 1</b>		
	<b>Year 2</b>		
	<b>Year 3</b>		
<b>MES Life Safety</b> 33596 Sterling Ponds Blvd Sterling Heights, MI 48312		\$120.00	5.00%
		\$126.00	5.00%
		\$132.30	5.00%
<b>Safety Services Inc</b> 850 Bride St NW Grand Rapids, MI 49504		\$109.00	0.00%
		at renewal	at renewal
		at renewal	at renewal